BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 7 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF
LEE'S SUMMIT, MISSOURI, THE LEE'S SUMMIT BUILDING CODE BY REPEALING
ARTICLES 2, 3, 4, 5, 6 AND 9; AND ADOPTING NEW ARTICLES 2, 3, 4, 5, 6 AND 9
PERTAINING TO THE SAME SUBJECT MATTER TO INCORPORATE NEW PROVISION OF
THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODES AND THE 2017 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL
CODE AND MODIFY OR RETAIN CERTAIN EXISTING PROVISIONS OF THE BUILDING
CODE AND ELECTRICAL CODE.

WHEREAS, the 2018 International Building Code, 2018 International Residential Code, 2017
National Electrical Code, 2018 International Plumbing Code, 2018 International Mechanical Code,
2018 International Fuel Gas Code and other revised building regulations have been extensively
reviewed by the Development Services Department, the Fire Department, the Board of Appeals,
members of professional trade associations, members of the construction community, and the
Community & Economic Development Committee; and,

WHEREAS, after much technical study and ample public input, the Development Services
Department, the Board of Appeals, and the Community & Economic Development Committee
believe that it is in the best interests of the City of Lee's Summit to repeal in its entirety Chapter
7, Building and Building Regulations of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Lee’s Summit,
Missouri to remain current with the most recently published International Codes, including the
2018 International Building Code, the 2018 International Residential Code, the 2017 National
Electrical Code, the 2018 International Plumbing Code, the 2018 International Mechanical Code,
the 2018 International Fuel Gas Code, and State law; and,

WHEREAS, based on staff reports and public comment, the City Council desires to protect
the public health, safety, and welfare by repealing Articles 2, 3, 4, 5, 6 and 9; and adopting new
Articles 2, 3, 4, 5, 6 and 9 pertaining to the same subject matter; and,

WHEREAS, The City of Lee’s Summit pursuant to the Lee’s Summit City Charter, the
Missouri State Constitution, and the City’s police powers has the authority to regulate for the
public health, safety, and welfare.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LEE'S SUMMIT,
MISSOURI, as follows:

SECTION 1. Chapter 7, Building and Building Regulations, of the Code of Ordinances of the
City of Lee’s Summit, Missouri, is hereby amended by (i) adopting into Chapter 7 those parts of the
2018 International Building Code as published by the International Code Council, Inc. (First Printing,
August 2017, ISBN 978-1-60983-735-8) (the “2018 IBC") as set forth below in this Section, (ii)
modifying certain sections and portions of the 2018 IBC as set forth below in this Section and (iii)
retaining those portions of the current Chapter 7 as set forth below:

ARTICLE | ADMINISTRATION

No changes shall be made to the currently adopted Article | of Chapter 7, and Article | of the
2018 IBC shall not be incorporated into Chapter 7.

Page 1



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

ARTICLE II. - BUILDING CODE
Sec. 7-200. - International Building Code adopted.

The 2018 IBC, including Appendices C and |, and the most current errata as published by
the International Code Council from time to time, is hereby adopted and incorporated in this
chapter as fully as if set forth herein, except for those parts or portions thereof as are
specifically added or amended by the language below.

Sec. 7-201. - International Building Code deleted; Chapter 1. Administration.
Chapter 1, Administration is hereby deleted. See Article | of this chapter.

Sec. 7-202. - International Building Code amended; Section 405.1. General.

Section 405.1 is hereby amended td read as follows: Exception 7. Structures as defined in
the LSCO Chapter 7, Section 7-1300 Subterranean Space Building and Fire Code.

Sec. 7-203- International Building Code amended; Section 423.4. Storm Shelters.

Section 423.4 is hereby amended to add the following language: Exception 4. Group E
occupancies that undergo alterations or additions where the cost of compliance with ICC
500 Section 702 is greater than 20% of the total project cost may omit the requirements of
ICC 500 Section 702 only.

Sec. 7-204 . - International Building Code amended; Section 501.2. Premises identification.

Section 501.2 is hereby amended to add the following language: In multi-tenant commercial
buildings where tenants have multiple entrances located on different sides of the building,
each door shall be addressed. Address characters shall be capable of being illuminated by
an internal or external lighting source.

Sec. 7-205. - International Building Code amended; Section 901.5. Acceptance test.

Section 901.5 is hereby amended to read as follows: Fire detection and alarm systems,
fire extinguishing systems, fire hydrant systems, fire standpipe systems, fire pump systems,
private fire service main and all other fire protection systems and appurtenances thereto shall
be subject to acceptance test(s) as contained in the installation standards and as approved
by the Code Official. The Code Official shall be notified forty-eight (48) hours before any
required acceptance testing.

Sec. 7-206. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.2.4. Group F.

Section 903.2.4 Group F is hereby amended to read as follows:Group F-1. An
automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all buildings containing a Group F-
1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 m2).

Page 2



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

2. A Group F-1 fire area is located more than two stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas on all floors, including any
mezzanines, exceeds 24,000 square feet (2230 m2).

4. A Group F-1 occupancy used for the manufacture of upholstered furniture or
mattresses exceeds 2,500 square feet (232 m2).

Sec. 7-207. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.2.7. Group M.

Section 903.2.7 is hereby amended as follows: An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided throughout buildings containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following
conditions exist:

A. A Group M fire area exceeds twelve thousand (12,000) square feet (1,115 m 2).
B. A Group M fire area is located more than two (2) stories above grade plane.

C. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds twenty-four thousand (24,000) square feet (2,230 m 2).

D. A Group M occupancy used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture or
mattresses exceed five thousand (5,000) square feet (464 m 2).

Sec. 7-208. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.2.9. Group S-1.

Section 903.2.9 is hereby amended to read as follows: An automatic sprinkler system
shall be provided throughout all buildings containing a group S-1 occupancy where one of
the following conditions exists:

A.  Where a group S-1 fire area exceeds twelve thousand (12,000) square feet (1,115
m?2).

B. Agroup S-1 fire area is located more than two (2) stories above grade.

C. The combined area of all group S-1 fire areas on all floors, including any
mezzanines, exceeds twenty-four thousand (24,000) square feet (2,230 m 2).

D. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial trucks or buses where the
fire area exceeds five thousand (5,000) square feet (464 m 2).

E. A Group S-1 occupancy used for the storage of upholstered furniture or mattresses
exceeds two thousand five hundred (2,500) square feet (232 m 2).

Sec. 7-209. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.2.9.1. Repair garages.

Section 903.2.9.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: An automatic sprinkler system
shall be provided throughout all buildings used as repair garages in accordance with Section
4086, as shown:

A. Buildings two (2) or more stories in height, including basements, with a fire area
containing a repair garage exceeding five thousand (5,000) square feet (464 m ?).

Page 3



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

B.  Buildings no more than one story above grade plane with a fire area containing a
repair garage exceeding five thousand (5,000) square feet (464 m 2).

C. Buildings with a repair garages servicing vehicles parked in basements.

D. A Group S-1 fire area used for the repair of commercial trucks or buses where the
fire area exceeds five thousand (5,000) square feet (464 m 2).

Sec. 7-210. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.2.11.3. Buildings 55 feet
or more in height.

Section 903.2.11.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: Buildings more than two
stories in height. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout buildings with a
floor level more than two stories above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

Exceptions:

1. Open parking garages"

Sec. 7-211. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.3.7. Fire Department
connection.

Section 903.3.7 is hereby added to read as follows: The location of Fire Department
connections shall be approved by the Fire Code Official. Connections shall be four-inch Storz
type fittings and located within one hundred (100) feet of a fire hydrant, or as approved by
the Fire Code Official.

Sec. 7-212. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.4. Sprinkler system
supervision and alarms.

Section 903.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: Valves controlling the water supply
for automatic sprinkler systems, pumps, tanks, water levels and temperatures, critical air
pressures and waterflow switches on all sprinkler systems shall be electrically supervised by
a listed fire alarm control unit.

Exceptions:

1. Automatic sprinkler systems protecting one- and two family dwellings.

2. Limited area sprinkler systems in accordance with Section 903.3.8.

3. Automatic sprinkler systems installed in accordance with NFPA 13R where a

common supply main is used to supply both domestic water and the automatic

sprinkler system, and a separate shutoff valve for the automatic sprinkler system is

not provided.

Jockey pump control valves that are sealed or locked in the open position.

Control valves to commercial kitchen hoods, paint spray booths or dip tanks that are

sealed or locked in the open position.

6. Valves controlling the fuel supply to fire pump engines that are sealed or locked in
the open position.

7. Trim valves to pressure switches in dry, preaction and deluge sprinkler systems that
are sealed or locked in the open position.

8. lIsolation valves for the backflow prevention devices remotely located in pits which
are locked and/or chained in the open position.

o~

Page 4



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

Sec. 7-213. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.4.2. Alarms.

Section 903.4.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: One all-weather horn/strobe shall
be connected to every automatic sprinkler system on the exterior of the building above the
FD connection or in an approved location. Such sprinkler water-flow alarm devices shall be
activated by water flow equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice size
installed in the system. Where a fire alarm system is installed, actuation of the automatic
sprinkler system shall actuate the building fire alarm system. Interior alarm notification
appliances shall be installed as required by Section 903.4.2.1.

Sec. 7-214. - International Building Code amended; Section 903.4.2.1. Notification device.

Section 903.4.2.1 is hereby added to read as follows: Where an automatic fire sprinkler
system is installed in a building, audible and visible notification appliances shall be installed
throughout the building as follows:

A. Audible notification appliances shall be installed so as to be audible at fifteen (15)
dBa above sound pressure level throughout the building.

B. Visible notification appliances shall be installed in all public and common use areas,
restrooms and corridors in accordance with the spacing requirements of NFPA 72.

C. Visible notification devices can be eliminated in normally unoccupied portions of
buildings where permitted by the Fire Code Official.

Exception: The requirements of this section do not apply to Group R-3 occupancies.
Sec. 7-215. - International Building Code amended; Section 905.3. Required installations.

Section 905.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: Standpipe systems shall be
provided in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 905.2 through 905.11,
and as required by the fire code official. In buildings used for high-piled combustible
storage, fire protection shall be in accordance with Chapter 32,

Sec. 7-216. - International Building Code amended; Section 905.3.1. Height.

Section 905.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Class Il standpipe systems shall
be installed throughout buildings where any of the following conditions exist:

1. Three or more stories are above or below grade plane.

2. The floor level of the highest story is located more than two stories above the
lowest level of the fire department vehicle access.

3. The floor level of the lowest story is located more than two stories below the
highest level of fire department vehicle access.

Exceptions:

1. Class | standpipes are allowed in buildings equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2.

2. Class | standpipes are allowed in Group B and E occupancies.

Page 5



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

3. Class | manual standpipes are allowed in open parking garages where the highest
floor is located not more than 150 feet (45 720 mm) above the lowest level of fire
department vehicle access.

4. Class | manual dry standpipes are allowed in open parking garages that are
subject to freezing temperatures, provided that the hose connections are located
as required for Class Il standpipes in accordance with Section 905.5.

5. Class | standpipes are allowed in basements equipped throughout with an
automatic sprinkler system.

6. Class | standpipes are allowed in buildings where occupant-use hose lines will not
be utilized by trained personnel or the fire department.

7. In determining the lowest level of fire department vehicle access, it shall not be
required to consider either of the following:

a. Recessed loading docks for four vehicles or less.
b. Conditions where topography makes access from the fire department
vehicle to the building impractical or impossible.

8. Standpipe systems are not required in Group R-3 occupancies and Group R-2
occupancies 3 stories or less where individual units egress directly to the exterior
or unenclosed stairwells, and the building is equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system.

Sec. 7-218. - International Building Code amended; Section 905.3.4.1. Hose and cabinet.
Section 905.3.4.1 is hereby deleted.

Sec. 7-219. - International Building Code amended; Section 905.3.5. Underground
buildings.

Section 905.3.5 is hereby amended to read as follows: Underground buildings shall be
equipped throughout with a Class | automatic wet or manual wet standpipe system.
Subterranean spaces developed by the extraction of subsurface material from underground
spaces shall also be regulated by the City of Lee's Summit Subterranean Building and Fire
Code.

Sec. 7-220. - International Building Code amended; Section 907.2.7.1. Occupant
notification.

Section 907.2.7.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: During times that the building
is occupied, the initiation of a signal from a manual fire alarm box or from a water flow switch
shall not be required to activate the alarm notification appliances when an alarm signal is
activated at a constantly attended location from which evacuation instructions shall be
initiated over an emergency voice/alarm communication system installed in accordance with
Section 907.5.2.2 and only when approved by the Fire Code Official.

Sec. 7-221. - International Building Code amended; Section 912.2 Location.

Section 912 Location is hereby amended to read as follows: With respect to hydrants,
driveways, buildings and landscaping, fire department connections shall be so located that
fire apparatus and hose connected to supply the system will not obstruct access to the

Page 6



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

buildings for other fire apparatus. The location of fire department connections shall be
within 100 feet of an approved fire hydrant or as approved by the fire code official.

Sec. 7-222. - International Building Code amended; Section 1008.1.9.3. Locks and latches.

Section 1008.1.9.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: Egress doors shall be readily
openable from the egress side without the use of a key or special knowledge or effort.

Exceptions:
A. Places of detention or restraint.

B. Where egress doors are used in pairs, approved automatic flush bolts shall be
permitted to be used, provided that the door leaf having the automatic flush bolts
has no doorknob or surface-mounted hardware. The unlatching of any leaf shall not
require more than one operation.

C. Doors from individual dwelling units and guestrooms of Group R occupancies
having an occupant load of ten (10) or less are permitted to be equipped with a night
latch, dead bolt or security chain, provided such devices are openable from the
inside without the use of a key or tool.

Sec. 7-223. - International Building Code amended; Section 1015.2. Guards.

Section 1015.2 Where Required is hereby amended to add the following: Guards are required
at retaining walls over 30”above grade when walking surfaces are within (10) feet of the high
side of the retaining wall.

Exceptions remain unchanged.
Sec. 7-224. - International Building Code amended; Section 1010.1.9.4 Locks & Latches

Section 1010.1.9.4 Locks & Latches shall be amended as follows:

"Locks and latches shall be permitted to prevent operation of doors where any of the
following exist:

1. Places of detention or restraint.

2. Where egress doors are used in pairs, approved automatic flush bolts shall be
permitted to be used, provided that the door leaf having the automatic flush bolts does
not have a doorknob or surface-mounted hardware.

3. Doors from individual dwelling or sleeping units of Group R occupancies having an
occupant load of 10 or less are permitted to be equipped with a night latch, dead bolt or
security chain, provided such devices are openable from the inside without the use of a
key or tool.

4. Fire doors after the minimum elevated temperature has disabled the unlatching
mechanism in accordance with listed fire door test procedures.

5. Doors serving roofs not intended to be occupied shall be permitted to be locked,
preventing entry to the building from the roof."

Exceptions:

Page 7



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

A.  The net free cross-ventilation area shall be permitted to be reduced to one-three
hundredth provided that not less than fifty (50) percent and not more than eighty
(80) percent of the required ventilation area provided by ventilators located in the
upper portion of the space to be ventilated at least three (3) feet above eave or
cornice vents with the balance of the required ventilation provided by eave or cornice
vents.

B. The net free cross-ventilation area shall be permitted to be reduced to one-three
hundredth where a Class | or Il vapor barrier is installed on the warm-in-winter side
of the ceiling.

Sec. 7-225. - International Building Code amended; Chapter 13. Energy efficiency.
Chapter 13 of the 2018 IBC is hereby deleted.

Sec. 7-226. - International Building Code amended; Table 1505.1.
Table 1505.1 is hereby amended by deleting footnotes a, b, and c from the table.

Sec. 7-227. - International Building Code Amended; Section 1505.5. Non-classified roofing.

Section 1505.5 is amended to read as follows: Non-classified roofing shall not be
installed unless utilized for the repair of ten (10) percent or less of the total roof covering in
any three-year period.

Sec. 7-228. - International Building Code Amended; Section 1511.1. Reroofing.

Section 1511.1. Reroofing is amended to add the following: Re-roofing includes any repairs
of more than 10% or less of the total roof covering in any three year period. A repair of 10%
or less of the total roof covering in any three year period may utilize approved roofing
materials comparable to the existing roofing materials.

Sec. 7-229. - International Building Code amended; Section 1804.4.1 Site Grading.

Section 1804.4.1 Site Grading shall be amended to add the following language:

A. Alldrainage facilities shall be designed to carry waters to the nearest drainage way,
storm sewer conveyance, or other approved point of collection and conveyance.
Erosion of ground in the area of discharge shall be prevented by installation of
erosive control devices. Unless specified drainage ways and swales are specifically
approved by the Building Official, abutting property lines between structures shall
be designed to function as drainage ways. The toe of slopes shall set back from the
property line a minimum of one foot. The area surrounding the building foundation
shall have a drainage gradient as provided for in the International Building Code, as
amended from time to time with draining gradient thereafter of not less than two (2)
percent toward approved drainage facilities unless waived by the Building Official.

B. Prohibited conduct: No person shall allow or cause any:

Page 8



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

1. Obstruction to be created, installed or maintained within any drainage way,
detention facility, or engineered swale which will create ponding on adjacent
property, divert water onto the adjoining property, or impede drainage. Fences
may be erected in such areas provided they do not unnecessarily restrict the
flow of water.

2.  Water form intermittent sources such as discharges from sump pumps,
downspouts, foundation drains, swimming pools, swimming pool backwashes,
or other similar sources excluding lawn sprinklers to be discharged closer than
five (5) feet from any adjoining property line.

C. Enforcement: Where such conditions exist and the Code Official has given written
notice of the violation, the owner of the property shall take appropriate measures to
eliminate the problems caused on the adjacent property, within the time period
stated on the notice, and failure to do so shall be a violation of this chapter.

Sec. 7-230. - International Building Code amended; Section 1805.4. Subsoil Drainage
System

Section 1805.4. Subsoil Drainage System amended to add the following: Where
foundations retain earth and enclose habitable or usable space located below grade, drains
shall be provided below the floor slab. Drainage tiles, perforated pipe or other approved
systems or materials shall be installed at or below the area(s) to be protected; shall be placed
with positive or neutral slope to minimize the accumulation of deposits in the drainage system;
and shall discharge by gravity or mechanical means to an approved storm water drainage
system. The under-slab drainage system shall be installed around the inner perimeter of the
area(s) to be protected, or, in a manner that will provide adequate drainage for all area(s) to
be protected and is approved by the Building Official. Interior underslab drains installed on
uncompacted fill material shall be supported by mechanical means which are adequately tied
into the concrete slab to ensure proper drainage throughout the underslab drain(s).

Sec. 7-231. - International Building Code amended; Section 3109 Swimming
Pools/Spas/Hot Tubs.

Section 3109 Swimming Pools/Spas/Hot Tubs will be deleted.

ARTICLE IIl. - ELECTRICAL CODE

Sec. 7-300. - National Electrical Code adopted.

The 2011 edition of the National Electrical Code as published by the National Fire Protection
Association (NFPA No. 70-2017) is hereby adopted and incorporated in this chapter as fully
as if set forth herein, excepting only such parts or portions thereof as are specifically added
or amended as stated below.

Sec. 7-301. - National Electrical Code amended; Section 210.8(A)(5). Unfinished portions
or areas of the basement not intended as habitable rooms

Page 9



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

Section 210.8(A)(5) is hereby amended to read as follows: All 125-volt, single phase, 15-
and 20- ampere receptacles installed in unfinished basements shall have ground fault
circuit interrupter protection for personnel. For the purposes of this section, unfinished
basements are defined as portions or areas of the basement not intended as habitable
rooms and limited to storage areas, work areas, and the like.

Exceptions:

1. Receptacles that are not readily accessible such as a ceiling mounted receptacle for
a garage door opener.

2. A single receptacle supplied by a dedicated branch circuit that is located and
identified for a specific use by a cord-and-plug-connected appliance such as a
refrigerator, freezer or sump pump.

3. Areceptacle supplying only a permanently installed fire alarm or burglar alarm
system.

Sec. 7-302. - National Electrical Code amended; Section 210.52(C)(5). Receptacle Outlet
Location.

Section 210.52(C)(5) is hereby amended to read as follows: Receptacle outlets shall be
located not more than 20 inches (508 mm) above the countertop or work surface.
Receptacle outlet assemblies installed in countertops and work surfaces shall be listed for
use in countertops or work surfaces. Receptacle outlets rendered not readily accessible by
appliances fastened in place, appliance garages, sinks or rangetops as covered in
210.52(C)(1), Exception, or appliances occupying dedicated space shall not be considered
as these required outlets.

EXCEPTION: Receptacle outlets shall be permitted to be mounted not more than 12 inches
(305 mm) below the countertop or work surface in construction designed for the physically
impaired or for island and peninsular countertops or work surface where the surface is flat
across its entire surface and the are no means to mount a receptacle within 20 inches (508
mm) above the countertop, such as in an overhead cabinet. Receptacles mounted below
the countertop or work surface in accordance with this section shall not be located where
the countertop or work surface extends more than 6 inches (152 mm) beyond its support
base.

Sec. 7-303. - National Electrical Code amended; Section 230.70(A)(1). Readily accessible
location.

Section 230.70(A)(1) is hereby amended to read as follows: The service disconnecting
means shall be installed at a readily accessible location either outside of a building or inside
nearest the point of entrance of the service conductors. When service entrance conductors
are more than ten (10) feet in length from the point of entry to the service panel, a separate
means of disconnect must be installed at the service cable entrance to the building or
structure.

Page 10



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

ARTICLE IV. - PLUMBING CODE
Sec. 7-400. - International Plumbing Code adopted.

The 2018 edition of the International Plumbing Code, and its most current errata as
published by the International Code Council from time to time is hereby adopted and
incorporated in this chapter as fully as if set forth herein, excepting only such parts or portions
thereof as are specifically added or amended.

Sec. 7-401. - International Plumbing Code deleted; Chapter 1. Administration.
Chapter 1, Administration is hereby deleted. See Article | of this chapter.

Sec. 7-402. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 305.4.1. Sewer depth.

Section 305.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Building sewers shall be installed
a minimum of twelve (12) inches (304.8 mm) below grade.

Sec. 7-403. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 312.10. Inspection and
testing of backflow prevention assemblies.

Section 312.10 is hereby amended to read as follows: Inspection and testing of backflow
prevention assemblies shall be in accordance with the policies prescribed by the Water
Utilities Department of the City of Lee's Summit, MO.

Sec. 7-404. - International Plumbing Code amended; Table 403.1.

Table 403.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Footnote g — A service sink may not
be required, at the discretion of the Building Official, if deemed unnecessary due to the size,
type and finish of the space.

Sec. 7-405. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 403.4.1. Directional signage.

Section 403.4.1 is hereby deleted.

Sec. 7-406. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 410.4. Substitution.

Section 410.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: In other occupancies, where
drinking fountains are required, water coolers, bottled water dispensers or break rooms with
a kitchen sink shall be permitted to be substituted for the required drinking fountains.

Page 11



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

Sec. 7-407. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 607.2. Hot or tempered water
supply to fixtures.

Section 607.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: The developed length of hot or
tempered water piping, from the source of hot water to the fixtures that require hot or
tempered water, shall not exceed 100 feet (30,480mm).

Sec. 7-408. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 608.15.2. Protection of
backflow preventers.

Section 608.15.2 is hereby amended to add the following language:

Exception: In-ground back-flow devices for lawn irrigation systems.

Sec. 7-409. — International Plumbing Code amended; Section 714.1 Backwater Valves
Section 714.1 is hereby deleted.

Sec. 7-410. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 903.1. Roof extension.

Section 903.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Open vent pipes that extend
through a roof shall be terminated not less than six (6) inches (152.4 mm) above the roof.
Where a roof is to be used for assembly or as a promenade, observation deck, sunbathing
deck or similar purposes, open vent pipes shall terminate not less than seven (7) feet (2,134
mm) above the roof.

Sec. 7-411. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 918.1. General.

Section 918.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Air admittance valve are only
allowed when approved by the Administrative Authority. Vent systems utilizing air admittance
valves shall comply with this section. Stack-type air admittance valves shall conform to ASSE
1050. Individual- and branch-type air admittance valves shall conform to ASSE 1051.

Sec. 7-412. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 1002.4. Trap seals.

Section 1002.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: Each fixture trap shall have a
liquid seal of not less than two (2) inches (51 mm) and not more than four (4) inches (102
mm), or deeper for special designs relating to accessible fixtures. Where a trap seal is subject
to loss by evaporation, a deep-seal trap consisting of a four-inch (102 mm) seal or a trap seal
primer valve shall be installed. A trap seal primer valve shall conform to ASSE 1018 or ASSE
1044.

Page 12



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

Sec. 7-413. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 1101.3. Prohibited drainage.

Section 1101.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: Sanitary sewer systems shall be
designed, built and maintained in such a manner to prevent all storm or ground water from
draining, discharging or entering into the sanitary sewer system. Connection of sump pumps,
foundation drains, yard drains, gutter downspouts and any other storm water drainage
receptacle(s) or system(s) are specifically prohibited from being connected to the sanitary
sewer system.

Sec. 7-414. - International Plumbing Code amended; Section 1113.1.1. Pump capacity and
head.

Section 1113.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Sumps receiving storm water
from any exposed exterior drain(s) or opening(s) shall be provided with back-up system(s)
capable of assuring proper sump operation in case of power failure.

ARTICLE V. - MECHANICAL CODE
Sec. 7-500. - International Mechanical Code adopted.

The 2018 edition of the International Mechanical Code, and its most current errata as
published by the International Code Council is hereby adopted and incorporated in this
chapter as fully as if set forth herein, excepting only such parts or portions thereof as are
specifically added or amended as stated below.

Sec. 7-501. - International Mechanical Code deleted; Chapter 1. Administration.

Chapter 1, Administration is hereby deleted. See Article | of this chapter.

Sec. 7-502. - International Mechanical Code amended; Section 401.2. Ventilation required.

Section 401.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: Every occupancy space shall be
ventilated by natural means in accordance with Section 402 or by mechanical means in
accordance with Section 403,

ARTICLE VI. - FUEL GAS CODE
Sec. 7-600. - International Fuel Gas Code adopted.

The 2018 edition of the International Fuel Gas Code, and its most current errata as
published by the International Code Council is hereby adopted and incorporated in this
chapter as fully as if set forth herein, excepting only such parts or portions thereof as are
specifically added or amended as set forth below.

Page 13



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

Sec. 7-601. - International Fuel Gas Code deleted; Chapter 1. Administration.

Chapter 1, Administration is hereby deleted. See Article | of this chapter.
Sec. 7-602. - International Fuel Gas Code amended; Section 403.4.3. Copper and brass.

Section 403.4.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: Copper and brass tubing shall
not be utilized to distribute fuel gas.

Sec. 7-603. - International Fuel Gas Code amended; Section 403.4.4. Aluminum.

Section 403.4.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: Aluminum or aluminum alloy
tubing shall not be utilized for the distribution of fuel gas.

Sec. 7-604. - International Fuel Gas Code amended, Section 403.5.1. Steel tubing.

Section 403.5.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Steel tubing shall not be utilized
to distribute natural gas nor shall it be utilized to distribute any other fuel gas within a building
or structure.

Sec. 7-605. - International Fuel Gas Code amended, Section 403.5.2. Copper and brass
tubing.

Section 403.5.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: Copper and brass tubing shall
not be utilized to distribute natural gas nor shall it be utilized to distribute any other fuel gas
within a building or structure.

Sec. 7-606. - International Fuel Gas Code amended, Section 403.5.3. Aluminum tubing.

Section 403.5.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: Aluminum tubing shall not be
utilized to distribute natural gas nor shall it be utilized to distribute any other fuel gas within a
building or structure.

Sec. 7-607. - International Fuel Gas Code amended, Section 406.4.1. Test pressure.

Section 406.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: The test pressure to be used shall
be not less than one and one-half times the proposed maximum working pressure, but not
less than ten (10) psig (68.9 kPa) irrespective of design pressure. For welded piping, and for
piping carrying gas at pressures in excess of fourteen (14) inches water column pressure,
the test pressure shall not be less than sixty (60) psig. Where the test pressure exceeds one
hundred twenty-five (125) psig (862 kPa), the test pressure shall not exceed a value that
produces a hoop stress in the piping greater than fifty (50) percent of the specified minimum
yield strength of the pipe.

ARTICLE VIl PRIVATE SEWAGE DISPOSAL
No changes are proposed for the currently adopted article.

ARTICLE VIl ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE
No changes are proposed for the currently adopted article.

7-900. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADOPTED. The 2018 edition of the
International Residential Code, including appendices E, H, and J, and its most current

Page 14



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

errata as published by the International Code Council is hereby adopted and incorporated
in this chapter as fully as if set forth herein, excepting only such parts or portions thereof as
are specifically added or amended.

7-901. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; CHAPTER 1.
ADMINISTRATION. Chapter 1, entitled Administration is hereby deleted. (See Article | of
this Chapter)

7-902. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DATA ENTRY; TABLE R301.2(1).
TABLE R301.2(1) CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA. Table R301.2(1)
shall include the following data:

Ground Snow Load: Twenty (20) pounds per square foot.
Wind Speed: Ninety (90) miles per hour.

Seismic Design Category: A

Weathering: Severe.

Frost Line Depth: Thirty-six (36) inches.

Termite: Moderate to Heavy

Decay: Slight to Moderate.

Winter Design Temperature: Six (6) degrees Fahrenheit.
Ice Shield Underlayment Required: Yes

Flood Hazards: See Article

Air Freezing Index: 927

Mean Annual Temperature: 55.5 degrees Fahrenheit
Manual J Design Criteria is hereby Deleted

7-903. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R302.5.1
OPENING PROTECTION. Section R302.5.1 Opening Protection is amended to read as
follows: Openings from a private garage directly into a room used for sleeping purposes
shall not be permitted. Other openings between the garage and residence shall be
equipped with solid wood doors not less than 1 3/8ths inches (35mm) in thickness, solid or
honeycomb core steel doors not less than 1 1/8ths inches (35mm) thick, or 20 minute fire-
rated doors, equipped with a self closing device.

Exception: Attic access openings shall not be required to be equipped with a self closing
device.

7-904. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R303.3
BATHROOMS. Section R303.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: Bathrooms, water

Page 15



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

closet compartments and other similar rooms shall be provided with aggregate glazing area
in windows of not less than 3 square feet (0.279 m2), one-half of which must be openable.

EXCEPTION: The glazed areas shall not be required where artificial light and a mechanical
ventilation system are provided. The minimum ventilation rates shall be 50 c¢fm (23.6L/s) for
intermittent ventilation or 20 cfm (9.4 L/s) for continuous ventilation. Ventilation air from the
space shall be exhausted directly to the outside or to an attic ventilated in accordance with
Section R806. The point of discharge of the exhaust air shall be at least 3 feet from any
opening into the building. Bathrooms which contain only a water closet or lavatory, or
combination thereof, and similar rooms, may be ventilated with an approved mechanical
recirculating fan or similar device designed to remove odors from the air.

7-905. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R303.4
MECHANICAL VENTILATION. Section R303.4 Mechanical Ventilation is hereby deleted.

7-906. — INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R311.3.2 FLOOR
ELEVATIONS FOR OTHER EXTERIOR DOORS. Section R311.3.2 Floor elevations for
other exterior doors is hereby amended to read as follows: Doors other than the required
egress door shall be provided with landings or floors not more than 7 % inches (196 mm)
below the top of the threshold.

EXCEPTION:

A landing is not required where a stairway of four or fewer risers is located on the exterior
side of the door, provided the door does not swing over the stairway.

7-907 .- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R311.7.8.5 GRIP
SIZE. Section R311.7.8.5 is hereby amended to read as follows; All required handrails
shall be of one of the following types or provide equivalent graspability.

1. Type |. Handrails with a circular cross section shall have an outside diameter of at least
1-1/4 inches (32mm) and not greater than 2 inches (51 mm). If the handrail is not circular it
shall have a perimeter dimension of at least 4 inches (102 mm) and not greater than 6-1/4
inches (160 mm) with a maximum cross section of dimension of 2-1/4 inches (57 mm).

2. Type Il. Handrails with a perimeter greater than 6-1/4 inches (160mm) shall provide a
graspable finger recess area on both sides of the profile. The finger recess shall begin
within a distance of 3/4 inch (19 mm) measured vertically from the tallest portion of the
profile and achieve a depth of at least 5/16 inch (8mm) within 7/8 inch (22mm) below the
widest portion of the profile. This required depth shall continue for at least 3/8 inch (10mm)
to a level that is not less than 1-3/4 inches (45 mm) below the tallest portion of the profile.
The minimum width of the handrail above the recess shall be 1-1/4 inches (32 mm) to a
maximum of 2-3/4 inches (70mm). Edges shall have a minimum radius of 0.01 inches (0.25
mm).

EXCEPTION:

Handrails provided at other non-required exterior stairs may have a maximum horizontal
cross-sectional dimension of 3-1/2 inches and shall be easily graspable.

Page 16



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

7-908. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R313
AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS. Section R313 is hereby amended to read as
follows: A builder of a one-and two family dwelling or townhouse shall offer to any
purchaser, on or before the time of entering into the purchase contract the option, at the
purchaser’s cost, to install or equip fire sprinklers in the one-and two-family dwelling or
townhouse. Notwithstanding any other provision of law to the contrary, no purchaser of
such one- and two family dwelling or townhouse shall be denied the right to install a fire
sprinkler system in such dwelling or townhouse being purchased. The provisions of this
section, which are intended to mirror the requirements of section RSMo 67.281, shall expire
on December 31st, 2022.

7-909. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R313.1
TOWNHOUSE AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS. Section R313.1 Townhouse
automatic fire sprinkler systems is hereby deleted.

7-910. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R313.2 ONE- AND
TWO FAMILY DWELLING AUTOMATIC FIRE SYSTEMS. Section R313.2 One- and two
family dwellings automatic fire systems is hereby deleted.

7-911. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; R317.1.1 FIELD
TREATMENT. Section R317.1.1 is hereby deleted.

7-912. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R318.1.2 FIELD
TREATMENT. Section R318.1.2 is hereby deleted.

7-913. — INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R326 SWIMMING
POOLS, SPAS AND HOT TUBS. Section 326 is hereby deleted.

7-914. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADDED; SECTION R401.3.1 MINIMUM
STANDARDS. Section R401.3.1 is hereby added to read as follows:

A. Minimum standards: All drainage facilities shall be designed to carry waters to the
nearest drainage way, storm sewer conveyance, or other approved point of collection and
conveyance. Erosion of ground in the area of discharge shall be prevented by installation of
erosive control devices. Unless specified drainage ways and swales are specifically
approved by the building official, abutting property lines between structures shall be
designed to function as drainage ways. The toe of slopes shall set back from the property
line a minimum of one foot. The area surrounding the building foundation shall have a
drainage gradient as provided for in the International Residential Code, as amended from
time to time with a draining gradient thereafter of not less than two percent toward approved
drainage facilities unless waived by the building official.

B. Prohibited conduct: No person shall allow or cause any:

1) Obstruction to be created, installed or maintained within any drainage way, detention
facility, or engineered swale which will create ponding on adjacent property, divert water
onto the adjoining property, or impede drainage. Fences may be erected in such areas
provided they do not unnecessarily restrict the flow of water.

Page 17



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

2) Water from intermittent sources such as discharges from sump pumps, downspouts,
foundation drains, swimming pools, swimming pool backwashes, or other similar sources
excluding lawn sprinklers to be discharged closer than five feet to any adjoining property
line.

C. Enforcement: Where such conditions exist and the code official has given written
notice of the violation, the owner of the property shall take appropriate measures to
eliminate the problems caused on the adjacent property, within the time period stated in the
notice, and failure to do so shall be a violation of this chapter.

7-915. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADDED; SECTION R403.1.1.1 FOOTING
REINFORCEMENT. Section R403.1.1.1 is hereby added to read as follows; Footings for
basement foundation walls shall have a minimum reinforcement consisting of not less than
two No. 4 bars, uniformly spaced, located a minimum of 3 inches clear from the bottom and
edges of the footing.

7-916. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADDED. SECTION R403.1.1.2 COLUMN
PADS. Section R403.1.1.2 is hereby added and reads as follows; Unless specified
otherwise, column pads shall be a minimum of 24 inches by 24 inches and 8 inches deep
(24” x 24" x 8"). Reinforcement shall consist of a minimum of three No. 4 bars each way,
uniformly spaced, within each column pad.

7-917. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R404.1.7
BACKFILL PLACEMENT. Section R404.1.7 is hereby amended to read as follows; Backfill
shall not be placed against the wall until the wall has sufficient strength or has been
sufficiently braced to prevent damage by the backfill.

EXCEPTION: Such bracing is not required for walls supporting less than 4 feet (1219 mm)
of unbalanced backfill.

7-918. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R405.2.3
DRAINAGE SYSTEM. Section R405.2.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: A sump
shall be provided to drain the porous layer, footings, and foundations that retain earth and
enclose habitable or usable space located below grade that do not drain and discharge by
gravity to an approved storm sewer system or to daylight. The sump shall be at least 24
inches (610mm) in diameter or 20 inches square (0.0129 m2), shall extend at least 24
inches (610mm) below the bottom of the basement floor and shall be capable of positive
gravity or mechanical drainage to remove any accumulated water. Sumps receiving storm
water from any exposed exterior drain(s) or opening(s) shall be provided with back-up
system(s) capable of assuring proper sump operation in case of power failure. The
drainage system shall discharge into an approved storm sewer system or to daylight.

7-919. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADDED; SECTION R506.2.5 INTERIOR
UNDERSLAB DRAINS. Section R506.2.5 is hereby added to read as follows: Where
foundations retain earth and enclose habitable or usable space located below grade, drains
shall be provided below the floor slab. Drainage tiles, perforated pipe or other approved
systems or materials shall be installed at or below the area(s) to be protected; shall be
placed with positive or neutral slope to minimize the accumulation of deposits in the
drainage system; and shall discharge by gravity or mechanical means to an approved
storm water drainage system. The underslab drainage system shall be installed around the

Page 18



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

inner perimeter of the area(s) to be protected, or, in a manner that will provide adequate
drainage for all area(s) to be protected and is approved by the building official. Interior
underslab drains installed on uncompacted fill material shall be supported by mechanical
means which are adequately tied into the concrete slab to ensure proper drainage
throughout the underslab drain(s).

7-920. — INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R507.9.2
LATERAL CONNECTION. Section R507.9.2 is hereby deleted.

7-921. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R602.1 DRILLING
AND NOTCHING OF THE TOP PLATE. Section R602.1 Drilling and notching of the top
plate is amended to read as follows: When piping or ductwork is placed in or partly in an
exterior wall or interior load bearing wall, necessitating cutting, drilling or notching of the top
plate by more than 50 percent of its width, a galvanized metal tie not less than 0.054 inch
thick (1.37 mm) (16 ga) and 1 %2 inches (38 mm) wide shall be fastened across and to the
plate at each side of the opening with not less than four 10d (0.148 inch diameter) having a
minimum length of 1 % inches (38 mm) at each side or equivalent. The metal tie must
extend a minimum of 6 inches past the opening. See figure R602.6.1

EXCEPTION: When the entire side of a wall with the notch or cut is covered by wood
structural panel sheathing.

7-922. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R801.3 ROOF
DRAINAGE. Section R801.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: All dwellings shall have
a controlled method of water disposal from roofs that will collect and discharge all roof
drainage to the ground surface at least three (3) feet from foundation walls or to an
approved drainage system.

7-923. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R902.1. ROOF
COVERING MATERIALS. Section R902.1 Roofing covering materials is hereby amended
to read as follows: Roofs shall be covered with materials as set forth in Sections R904 and
R905. Except where the code requires greater protection, roof coverings for new buildings
or structures or additions thereto, or roof coverings utilized for re-roofing shall be a
minimum of Class C. Class A, B or C roofing shall be installed in areas designated by law
as requiring their use or when the edge of the roof is less than 3 feet (914 mm) from a
property line. Classes A, B and C roofing required to be listed by this section shall be tested
in accordance with UL 790 or ASTM E 108. Roof assemblies with coverings of brick,
masonry, slate, clay or concrete roof tile, exposed concrete roof deck, ferrous or copper
shingles or sheets, and metal sheets and shingles, shall be considered Class A roof
coverings.

7-924. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R907.1
GENERAL. Section R907.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Materials and methods
of application used for re-covering or replacing an existing roof covering shall comply with
the requirements of Chapter 9 as amended. Re-roofing includes any repairs of more than
10% of the total roof covering in any three year period. A repair of 10% or less of the total
roof covering in any three year period may utilize approved roofing materials comparable to
the existing roofing materials.

Page 19



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

EXCEPTION: Re-roofing shall not be required to meet the minimum design slope
requirement of one-quarter unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (2-percent slope) in Section
R905 for roofs that provide positive roof drainage.

7-925. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; CHAPTER 11. Chapter 11 is
hereby deleted.(See Article 8 of this chapter)

7-926. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; CHAPTER 12. MECHANICAL
ADMINISTRATION. Chapter 12 is hereby deleted. (See article 1 of this chapter)

7-927. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION M1501.1
OUTDOOR DISCHARGE. Section M1501.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: The air
removed by every mechanical exhaust system shall be discharged to the outdoors. Air shall
not be exhausted into an attic, soffit, ridge vent or crawl space.

EXCEPTIONS:

1.) Whole-house ventilation-type attic fans that discharge into the attic space of dwelling
units having private attics shall be permitted.

2.) Bathroom exhaust fans installed in accordance with amended section R303.3.

7-928. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION M1507.2
RECIRCULATION OF AIR. Section M1507.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Exhaust air from bathrooms and toilet rooms shall not be recirculated within a residence or
to another dwelling unit and shall be exhausted in accordance with amended section
R303.3.

7-929.- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION G2414.5.2
COPPER TUBING. Section G2414.5.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: Copper
tubing shall comply with standard Type K or L of ASTM B 88 or ASTM B 280. Copper and
brass tubing shall not be utilized to distribute natural gas nor shall it be utilized to distribute
any other fuel gas within a building or structure.

7-930. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION G2417.4.1 TEST
PRESSURE. Section G2417.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows; The test pressure
to be used shall be not less than one and one-half times the proposed maximum working
pressure, but not less than 10 psig (68.9kPa) irrespective of design pressure. For welded
piping, and for piping carrying gas at pressures in excess of fourteen (14) inches water
column pressure, the test pressure shall not be less than 60 psig. Where the test pressure
exceeds 125 psig (862 kPa gauge), the test pressure shall not exceed a value that
produces a hoop stress in the piping greater than 50 percent of the specified minimum yield
strength of the pipe.

7-931. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; CHAPTER 25. PLUMBING
ADMINISTRATION. Chapter 25 is hereby deleted. (See Article 1 of this chapter)

7-932. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADDED; SECTION P2601.2.1
PROHIBITED DRAINAGE AND CONNECTIONS. Section P2601.2.1 is hereby added to
read as follows: Sanitary sewer systems shall be designed, built and maintained in such a

Page 20



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

manner to prevent all storm or ground water from draining, discharging or entering into the
sanitary sewer system. Connection of sump pumps, foundation drains, yard drains, gutter
downspouts and any other storm water drainage receptacle(s) or system(s) are specifically
prohibited from being connected to the sanitary sewer system.

7-933. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION P2603.5
FREEZING. Section P2603.5 is hereby amended to read as follows: Water, soil or waste
pipe shall not be installed outside of a building, in exterior walls, in attics or crawl spaces, or
in any other place subjected to freezing temperature unless adequate provision is made to
protect it from freezing by insulation or heat or both. Water service pipe shall be installed
not less than 42 inches in depth below grade.

7-934. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION P2603.5.1
SEWER DEPTH. Section P2603.5.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Building
sewers shall be a minimum of 12 inches below grade.

7-935.- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADDED; SECTION P2604.5
INSPECTION. Section P2604.5 is hereby added to read as follows: Excavations required
for the installation of a building drainage system shall be open trench work and shall be
kept open until the piping has been inspected and approved to cover.

7-936.- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION P2902.5.3 LAWN
IRRIGATION SYSTEMS. Section P2902.5.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: The
potable water supply to lawn irrigation systems shall be protected against backflow by a
device approved by the Missouri Department of Natural Resources. Backflow devices
installed within structures shall be installed a minimum of 6 inches away from any wall or
vertical obstruction. The backflow device shall be installed between 12 inches and 48
inches above the floor and shall be accessible.

7-937.- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION P2902.6.2
PROTECTION OF BACKFLOW PREVENTERS. Section P2902.6.2 Protection of backflow
preventers is hereby amended to read as follows: Backflow preventers shall not be located
in areas subject to freezing except where they can be removed by means of unions, or are
protected by heat, insulation or both.

EXCEPTION: In-ground backflow preventers installed for lawn irrigation systems.

7-938. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION P3002.2
BUILDING SEWER. Section P3002.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: Building sewer
piping shall be as shown in Table P3002.2. Forced main sewer piping shall conform to one
of the standards for ABS plastic pipe, cast-iron pipe, copper or copper-alloy tubing, PVC
plastic pipe, or pressure-rated pipe listed in Table P3002.2. In addition, building sewer
piping shall be a minimum of schedule 40 PVC/ABS or equivalent unless otherwise
approved by the building official.

7-939.- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION P3005.4.2
BUILDING DRAIN AND SEWER SIZE AND SLOPE. Section P3005.4.2 is hereby amended
to read as follows: Pipe sizes and slope shall be determined from Table P3005.4.2 on the
basis of drainage load in fixture units (d.f.u.) computed from Table P3004.1. The minimum
size of a building sewer serving a dwelling unit shall be fourinches.

Page 21



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

7-940. — INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION P3008.1
BACKWATER VALVES, Where required. Section P3008.1 is hereby deleted.

7-941.- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION P3114.3 WHERE
PERMITTED. Section P3114.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: Individual vents,
branch vents, circuit vents and stack vents shall be permitted to terminate with a connection
to an air admittance valve only when approved by the Administrative Authority.

7-942. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION E3601.6.2
SERVICE DISCONNECT LOCATION. Section E3601.6.2 is hereby amended to read as
follows: The service disconnecting means shall be installed at a readily accessible location
either outside of a building or inside nearest the point of entrance of the service conductors.
When service conductors are more than 10 feet in length from the point of entry to the
service panel, a separate means of disconnect shall be installed at the service cable
entrance to the building or structure. Service disconnecting means shall not be installed in
bathrooms. Each occupant shall have access to the disconnect serving the dwelling unit in
which they reside.

7-943.- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION E3901.4.5
RECEPTACLE OUTLET LOCATION. Section E3901.4.5 Receptacle outlet location is
hereby amended to read as follows: Receptacle outlets shall be located not more than 20
inches (508 mm) above the countertop or work surface. Receptacle outlet assemblies
installed in countertops and work surfaces shall be listed for use in countertops or work
surfaces. Receptacle outlets rendered not readily accessible by appliances fastened in
place, appliance garages, sinks or rangetops as addressed in the exception to Section
3901.4.1, or appliances occupying dedicated space shall not be considered as these
required outlets.

EXCEPTION: Receptacle outlets shall be permitted to be mounted not more than 12 inches
(305 mm) below the countertop or work surface in construction designed for the physically
impaired or for island and peninsular countertops or work surface where the surface is flat
across its entire surface and the are no means to mount a receptacle within 20 inches (508
mm) above the countertop, such as in an overhead cabinet. Receptacles mounted below
the countertop or work surface in accordance with this section shall not be located where
the countertop or work surface extends more than 6 inches (152 mm) beyond its support
base.

7-944 .- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION E3902.2 GARAGE
AND ACCESSORY BUILDING RECEPTACLES. Section E3902.2 Garage and accessory
building receptacles is hereby amended to read as follows: All 125-volt, single-phase, 15-
and 20- ampere receptacles installed in garages and grade level portions of unfinished
accessory buildings used for storage or work areas shall have ground-fault circuit
interrupter protection for personnel.

EXCEPTIONS:

1.) Receptacles that are not readily accessible such as a ceiling mounted receptacle for a
garage door opener.

Page 22



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

2.) A single receptacle supplied by a dedicated branch circuit that is located and identified
for a specific use by a cord-and-plug-connected appliance such as a refrigerator, freezer or
sump pump.

3.) A receptacle supplying only a permanently installed fire alarm or burglar alarm system.

7-945. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED,; SECTION E3902.5
UNFINISHED BASEMENT RECEPTACLES. Section E3902.5 Unfinished basement
receptacles is hereby amended to read as follows: All 125-volt, single phase, 15- and 20-
ampere receptacles installed in unfinished basements shall have ground fault circuit
interrupter protection for personnel. For the purposes of this section, unfinished basements
are defined as portions or areas of the basement not intended as habitable rooms and
limited to storage areas, work areas, and the like.

Exceptions:

1.) Receptacles that are not readily accessible such as a ceiling mounted receptacle for a
garage door opener.

2.) A single receptacle supplied by a dedicated branch circuit that is located and identified
for a specific use by a cord-and-plug-connected appliance such as a refrigerator, freezer or
sump pump.

3.) A receptacle supplying only a permanently installed fire alarm or burglar alarm system.

ARTICLE X SWIMMING POOL, SPA, AND HOT TUB CODE
No changes are proposed for the currently adopted article.

ARTICLE XI REMOVAL OF STRUCTURES
No changes are proposed for the currently adopted article.

ARTICLE XIl DANGEROUS AND NUISANCE BUILDING CODE
No changes are proposed for the currently adopted article.

ARTICLE Xlll SUBTERRANEAN SPACE BUILDING AND FIRE CODE
No changes are proposed for the currently adopted article.

ARTICLE XIV SECURITY CODE
No changes are proposed for the currently adopted article.

SECTION 2. That it is the intention of the City Council and it is hereby ordained that the
provisions of this ordinance shall become and be made a part of the Code of Ordinances for the
City of Lee’s Summit, Missouri.

SECTION 3. That this ordinance shall be in full force and effect on April 1, 2019 after the date
of its passage and adoption, and approval by the Mayor.

SECTION 4. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase or portion of this
Ordinance is for any reason held invalid or unconstitutional by any court of competent jurisdiction,

Page 23



BILL NO. 19-08 ORDINANCE NO. 8536

such portion shall be deemed a separate and independent provision and such holding shall not
affect the validity of the remaining portions thereof.

PASSED by the City Council of the City of Lee's Summit, Missouri, this 8 ciiay of
é;ﬂugg?g , 2019.

Mayor Willigr A. Baird

ATTEST:

L | <

City Clerk Trisha Fowler Arcuri

APPROVED by the Mayor of said city this Hﬁ' day of _~ E,)m z%‘ , 2019,
A}%%

Mayor William A. Baird

)

Yowler Arcuri

Page 24



2018 International Residential Code Amendments

7-900. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADOPTED. The 2018 edition of the
International Residential Code, including appendices E, H, and J, and its most current errata as
published by the International Code Council is hereby adopted and incorporated in this chapter
as fully as if set forth herein, excepting only such parts or portions thereof as are specifically
added or amended.

7-901. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; CHAPTER 1. ADMINISTRATION.
Chapter 1, entitled Administration is hereby deleted. (See Article | of this Chapter)

7-902. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DATA ENTRY; TABLE R301.2(1). TABLE
R301.2(1) CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA. Table R301.2(1) shall include
the following data:

Ground Snow Load: Twenty (20) pounds per square foot.
Wind Speed: Ninety (20) miles per hour.
Seismic Design Category: A
Weathering: Severe.
Frost Line Depth: Thirty-six (36) inches.
Termite: Moderate to Heavy
Decay: Slight to Moderate.
Winter Design Temperature: Six (6) degrees Fahrenheit.
Ice Shield Underlayment Required: Yes
Flood Hazards: See Article
Air Freezing Index: 927
Mean Annual Temperature: 55.5 degrees Fahrenheit
Manual J Design Criteria is hereby Deleted
-Added design criteria specific to this region.

7-903. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R302.5.1 OPENING
PROTECTION. Section R302.5.1 Opening Protection is amended to read as follows: Openings
from a private garage directly into a room used for sleeping purposes shall not be permitted.
Other openings between the garage and residence shall be equipped with solid wood doors not
less than 1 3/8ths inches (35mm) in thickness, solid or honeycomb core steel doors not less



than 1 1/8ths inches (35mm) thick, or 20 minute fire-rated doors, equipped with a self closing
device.

Exception: Attic access openings shall not be required to be equipped with a self closing device.
-States that a self closing device is not required on attic access openings

7-904. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R303.3
BATHROOMS. Section R303.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: Bathrooms, water closet
compartments and other similar rooms shall be provided with aggregate glazing area in
windows of not less than 3 square feet (0.279 m2), one-half of which must be openable.

EXCEPTION: The glazed areas shall not be required where artificial light and a mechanical
ventilation system are provided. The minimum ventilation rates shall be 50 c¢fm (23.6L/s) for
intermittent ventilation or 20 cfm (9.4 L/s) for continuous ventilation. Ventilation air from the
space shall be exhausted directly to the outside or to an attic ventilated in accordance with
Section R806. The point of discharge of the exhaust air shall be at least 3 feet from any
opening into the building. Bathrooms which contain only a water closet or lavatory, or
combination thereof, and similar rooms, may be ventilated with an approved mechanical
recirculating fan or similar device designed to remove odors from the air.

-States that bathroom exhaust can discharge into an attic area that is vented in
accordance with this code.

7-905. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R303.4 MECHANICAL
VENTILATION. Section R303.4 Mechanical Ventilation is hereby deleted.

-Removes the threshold for outdoor air into a home dwelling.

7-906. — INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R311.3.2 FLOOR
ELEVATIONS FOR OTHER EXTERIOR DOORS. Section R311.3.2 Floor elevations for other
exterior doors is hereby amended to read as follows: Doors other than the required egress door
shall be provided with landings or floors not more than 7 % inches (196 mm) below the top of
the threshold.

EXCEPTION:

A landing is not required where a stairway of four or fewer risers is located on the exterior side
of the door, provided the door does not swing over the stairway.

-Allows exterior doors other than the front door of a dwelling to have a maximum of four
steps on the outside of the door instead of a landing.

7-907.- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R311.7.8.5 GRIP SIZE.
Section R311.7.8.5 is hereby amended to read as follows; All required handrails shall be of one
of the following types or provide equivalent graspability.



1. Type |. Handrails with a circular cross section shall have an outside diameter of at least 1-1/4
inches (32mm) and not greater than 2 inches (51 mm). If the handrail is not circular it shall have
a perimeter dimension of at least 4 inches (102 mm) and not greater than 6-1/4 inches (160
mm) with a maximum cross section of dimension of 2-1/4 inches (57 mm).

2. Type Il. Handrails with a perimeter greater than 6-1/4 inches (160mm) shall provide a
graspable finger recess area on both sides of the profile. The finger recess shall begin within a
distance of 3/4 inch (19 mm) measured vertically from the tallest portion of the profile and
achieve a depth of at least 5/16 inch (8mm) within 7/8 inch (22mm) below the widest portion of
the profile. This required depth shall continue for at least 3/8 inch (10mm) to a level that is not
less than 1-3/4 inches (45 mm) below the tallest portion of the profile. The minimum width of the
handrail above the recess shall be 1-1/4 inches (32 mm) to a maximum of 2-3/4 inches (70mm).
Edges shall have a minimum radius of 0.01 inches (0.25 mm).

EXCEPTION:

Handrails provided at other non-required exterior stairs may have a maximum horizontal cross-
sectional dimension of 3-1/2 inches and shall be easily graspable.

-Allows for a 2X4 laid flat as a suitable handrail for a stairway on an exterior deck.

7-908. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R313 AUTOMATIC
FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS. Section R313 is hereby amended to read as follows: A builder
of a one-and two family dwelling or townhouse shall offer to any purchaser, on or before the
time of entering into the purchase contract the option, at the purchaser's cost, to install or equip
fire sprinklers in the one-and two-family dwelling or townhouse. Notwithstanding any other
provision of law to the contrary, no purchaser of such one- and two family dwelling or
townhouse shall be denied the right to install a fire sprinkler system in such dwelling or
townhouse being purchased. The provisions of this section, which are intended to mirror the
requirements of section RSMo 67.281, shall expire on December 31st, 2022.

-Amended to comply with state statute.

7-909. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R313.1 TOWNHOUSE
AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS. Section R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire
sprinkler systems is hereby deleted.

-Amended to comply with state statute.

7-910. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R313.2 ONE- AND
TWO FAMILY DWELLING AUTOMATIC FIRE SYSTEMS. Section R313.2 One- and two family
dwellings automatic fire systems is hereby deleted.

-Amended to comply with state statute.

7-911. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; R317.1.1 FIELD TREATMENT.
Section R317.1.1 is hereby deleted.



-Deletes the requirement for field treatment of cut ends of treated lumber.

7-912. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R318.1.2 FIELD
TREATMENT. Section R318.1.2 is hereby deleted.

-Deletes the requirement for field treatment of cut ends of treated lumber.

7-913. = INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R326 SWIMMING
POOLS, SPAS AND HOT TUBS. Section 326 is hereby deleted.

-Deletes the reference to the Swimming Pools, Spas and Hot Tubs code that is not
currently adopted.

7-914. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADDED; SECTION R401.3.1 MINIMUM
STANDARDS. Section R401.3.1 is hereby added to read as follows: A. Minimum standards:
All drainage facilities shall be designed to carry waters to the nearest drainage way, storm
sewer conveyance, or other approved point of collection and conveyance. Erosion of ground in
the area of discharge shall be prevented by installation of erosive control devices. Unless
specified drainage ways and swales are specifically approved by the building official, abutting
property lines between structures shall be designed to function as drainage ways. The toe of
slopes shall set back from the property line a minimum of one foot. The area surrounding the
building foundation shall have a drainage gradient as provided for in the International
Residential Code, as amended from time to time with a draining gradient thereafter of not less
than two percent toward approved drainage facilities unless waived by the building official.

B. Prohibited conduct: No person shall allow or cause any:

1) Obstruction to be created, installed or maintained within any drainage way, detention facility,
or engineered swale which will create ponding on adjacent property, divert water onto the
adjoining property, or impede drainage. Fences may be erected in such areas provided they do
not unnecessarily restrict the flow of water.

2) Water from intermittent sources such as discharges from sump pumps, downspouts,
foundation drains, swimming pools, swimming pool backwashes, or other similar sources
excluding lawn sprinklers to be discharged closer than five feet to any adjoining property line.

C. Enforcement: Where such conditions exist and the code official has given written notice of
the violation, the owner of the property shall take appropriate measures to eliminate the
problems caused on the adjacent property, within the time period stated in the notice, and
failure to do so shall be a violation of this chapter.

-Added storm water provisions that more clearly define acceptable discharge.

7-915. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADDED; SECTION R403.1.1.1 FOOTING
REINFORCEMENT. Section R403.1.1.1 is hereby added to read as follows; Footings for
basement foundation walls shall have a minimum reinforcement consisting of not less than two
No. 4 bars, uniformly spaced, located a minimum of 3 inches clear from the bottom and edges
of the footing.



-States a minimum standard for footing size and reinforcement.

7-916. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADDED. SECTION R403.1.1.2 COLUMN
PADS. Section R403.1.1.2 is hereby added and reads as follows; Unless specified otherwise,
column pads shall be a minimum of 24 inches by 24 inches and 8 inches deep (24" x 24" x 8").
Reinforcement shall consist of a minimum of three No. 4 bars each way, uniformly spaced,
within each column pad.

-States a minimum standard for column pad size and reinforcement.

7-917. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R404.1.7 BACKFILL
PLACEMENT. Section R404.1.7 is hereby amended to read as follows; Backfill shall not be
placed against the wall until the wall has sufficient strength or has been sufficiently braced to
prevent damage by the backfill.

EXCEPTION: Such bracing is not required for walls supporting less than 4 feet (1219 mm) of
unbalanced backfill.

-States that a concrete foundation wall can be backfilled once it has cured to a sufficient
strength.

7-918. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R405.2.3 DRAINAGE
SYSTEM. Section R405.2.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: A sump shall be provided to
drain the porous layer, footings, and foundations that retain earth and enclose habitable or
usable space located below grade that do not drain and discharge by gravity to an approved
storm sewer system or to daylight. The sump shall be at least 24 inches (610mm) in diameter
or 20 inches square (0.0129 m2), shall extend at least 24 inches (610mm) below the bottom of
the basement floor and shall be capable of positive gravity or mechanical drainage to remove
any accumulated water. Sumps receiving storm water from any exposed exterior drain(s) or
opening(s) shall be provided with back-up system(s) capable of assuring proper sump operation
in case of power failure. The drainage system shall discharge into an approved storm sewer
system or to daylight.

-Requires sump pumps that receive discharge from exterior daylight drains shall have a
battery backup system installed.

7-919. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADDED; SECTION R506.2.5 INTERIOR
UNDERSLAB DRAINS. Section R506.2.5 is hereby added to read as follows: Where
foundations retain earth and enclose habitable or usable space located below grade, drains
shall be provided below the floor slab. Drainage tiles, perforated pipe or other approved
systems or materials shall be installed at or below the area(s) to be protected; shall be placed
with positive or neutral slope to minimize the accumulation of deposits in the drainage system;
and shall discharge by gravity or mechanical means to an approved storm water drainage
system. The underslab drainage system shall be installed around the inner perimeter of the
area(s) to be protected, or, in a manner that will provide adequate drainage for all area(s) to be
protected and is approved by the building official. Interior underslab drains installed on



uncompacted fill material shall be supported by mechanical means which are adequately tied
into the concrete slab to ensure proper drainage throughout the underslab drain(s).

-Requires an interior drain tilfe under basement floor slabs to help prevent damage
caused from hydrostatic pressure from ground water.

7-920. — INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; SECTION R507.9.2 LATERAL
CONNECTION. Section R507.9.2 is hereby deleted.

-Deleted the requirement and reference to a diagram of a device installed on exterior
decks.

7-921. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R602.1 DRILLING
AND NOTCHING OF THE TOP PLATE. Section R602.1 Drilling and notching of the top plate is
amended to read as follows: When piping or ductwork is placed in or partly in an exterior wall or
interior load bearing wall, necessitating cutting, drilling or notching of the top plate by more than
50 percent of its width, a galvanized metal tie not less than 0.054 inch thick (1.37 mm) (16 ga)
and 1 ¥ inches (38 mm) wide shall be fastened across and to the plate at each side of the
opening with not less than four 10d (0.148 inch diameter) having a minimum length of 1 %
inches (38 mm) at each side or equivalent. The metal tie must extend a minimum of 6 inches
past the opening. See figure R602.6.1

EXCEPTION: When the entire side of a wall with the notch or cut is covered by wood structural
panel sheathing.

-Reduces the amount of nails required on each side of the over notched top plate from 8
nails to 4.

7-922. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R801.3 ROOF
DRAINAGE. Section R801.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: All dwellings shall have a
controlled method of water disposal from roofs that will collect and discharge all roof drainage to
the ground surface at least three (3) feet from foundation walls or to an approved drainage
system.

-Requires downspout discharge a minimum of 3 feet from the foundation wall.

7-223. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R902.1. ROOF
COVERING MATERIALS. Section R902.1 Roofing covering materials is hereby amended to
read as follows: Roofs shall be covered with materials as set forth in Sections R904 and R905.
Except where the code requires greater protection, roof coverings for new buildings or
structures or additions thereto, or roof coverings utilized for re-roofing shall be a minimum of
Class C. Class A, B or C roofing shall be installed in areas designated by law as requiring their
use or when the edge of the roof is less than 3 feet (914 mm) from a property line. Classes A, B
and C roofing required to be listed by this section shall be tested in accordance with UL 790 or
ASTM E 108. Roof assemblies with coverings of brick, masonry, slate, clay or concrete roof tile,
exposed concrete roof deck, ferrous or copper shingles or sheets, and metal sheets and
shingles, shall be considered Class A roof coverings.



-Establishes a minimum roof covering material for flame spread.

7-924. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION R907.1 GENERAL.
Section R907.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Materials and methods of application
used for re-covering or replacing an existing roof covering shall comply with the requirements of
Chapter 9 as amended. Re-roofing includes any repairs of more than 10% of the total roof
covering in any three year period. A repair of 10% or less of the total roof covering in any three
year period may utilize approved roofing materials comparable to the existing roofing materials.

EXCEPTION: Re-roofing shall not be required to meet the minimum design slope requirement
of one-quarter unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (2-percent slope) in Section R905 for roofs that
provide positive roof drainage.

-Defines what is considered re-roofing.

7-925. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; CHAPTER 11. Chapter 11 is
hereby deleted.(See Article 8 of this chapter)

-Deletes the energy provisions of the IRC.

7-926. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; CHAPTER 12. MECHANICAL
ADMINISTRATION. Chapter 12 is hereby deleted. (See article 1 of this chapter)

7-927. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION M1501.1 OUTDOOR
DISCHARGE. Section M1501.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: The air removed by
every mechanical exhaust system shall be discharged to the outdoors. Air shall not be
exhausted into an attic, soffit, ridge vent or crawl space.

EXCEPTIONS:

1.) Whole-house ventilation-type attic fans that discharge into the attic space of dwelling units
having private attics shall be permitted.

2.) Bathroom exhaust fans installed in accordance with amended section R303.3.

--States that bathroom exhaust can discharge into an attic area that is vented in
accordance with this code.

7-928. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION M1507.2
RECIRCULATION OF AIR. Section M1507.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: Exhaust
air from bathrooms and toilet rooms shall not be recirculated within a residence or to another
dwelling unit and shall be exhausted in accordance with amended section R303.3.

-States that bathroom exhaust can discharge into an attic area that is vented in
accordance with this code.

7-929.- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION G2414.5.2 COPPER
TUBING. Section G2414.5.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: Copper tubing shall comply
with standard Type K or L of ASTM B 88 or ASTM B 280. Copper and brass tubing shall not be



utilized to distribute natural gas nor shall it be utilized to distribute any other fuel gas within a
building or structure.

-States that copper tubing is prohibited material for distributing natural gas.

7-930. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION G2417.4.1 TEST
PRESSURE. Section G2417.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows; The test pressure to
be used shall be not less than one and one-half times the proposed maximum working
pressure, but not less than 10 psig (68.9kPa) irrespective of design pressure. For welded
piping, and for piping carrying gas at pressures in excess of fourteen (14) inches water column
pressure, the test pressure shall not be less than 60 psig. Where the test pressure exceeds 125
psig (862 kPa gauge), the test pressure shall not exceed a value that produces a hoop stress in
the piping greater than 50 percent of the specified minimum yield strength of the pipe.

-States the minimum guidelines for testing a fuel gas system.

7-931. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE DELETED; CHAPTER 25. PLUMBING
ADMINISTRATION. Chapter 25 is hereby deleted. (See Article 1 of this chapter)

7-932. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADDED; SECTION P2601.2.1 PROHIBITED
DRAINAGE AND CONNECTIONS. Section P2601.2.1 is hereby added to read as follows:
Sanitary sewer systems shall be designed, built and maintained in such a manner to prevent all
storm or ground water from draining, discharging or entering into the sanitary sewer system.
Connection of sump pumps, foundation drains, yard drains, gutter downspouts and any other
storm water drainage receptacle(s) or system(s) are specifically prohibited from being
connected to the sanitary sewer system.

-States prohibited connections to a sanitary sewer service system.

7-933. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION P2603.5 FREEZING.
Section P2603.5 is hereby amended to read as follows: Water, soil or waste pipe shall not be
installed outside of a building, in exterior walls, in attics or crawl spaces, or in any other place
subjected to freezing temperature unless adequate provision is made to protect it from freezing
by insulation or heat or both. Water service pipe shall be installed not less than 42 inches in
depth below grade.

-States the minimum burial depth for a water service line.

7-934. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION P2603.5.1 SEWER
DEPTH. Section P2603.5.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: Building sewers shall be a
minimum of 12 inches below grade.

-States the minimum burial depth for a sanitary sewer service line.

7-935.- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE ADDED; SECTION P2604.5 INSPECTION.
Section P2604.5 is hereby added to read as follows: Excavations required for the installation of
a building drainage system shall be open trench work and shall be kept open until the piping has
been inspected and approved to cover.



-States guidelines for sanitary sewer service lines for visual inspection.

7-936.- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION P2902.5.3 LAWN
IRRIGATION SYSTEMS. Section P2902.5.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: The
potable water supply to lawn irrigation systems shall be protected against backflow by a device
approved by the Missouri Department of Natural Resources. Backflow devices installed within
structures shall be installed a minimum of 6 inches away from any wall or vertical obstruction.
The backflow device shall be installed between 12 inches and 48 inches above the floor and
shall be accessible.

-States the backflow device installed on lawn irrigation systems shall comply with
Missouri Department of Natural Resources.

7-937 .- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION P2902.6.2
PROTECTION OF BACKFLOW PREVENTERS. Section P2902.6.2 Protection of backflow
preventers is hereby amended to read as follows: Backflow preventers shall not be located in
areas subject to freezing except where they can be removed by means of unions, or are
protected by heat, insulation or both.

EXCEPTION: In-ground backflow preventers installed for lawn irrigation systems.

-Allows backflow devices for irrigation systems to be installed at a depth less than the
frost line.

7-938. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION P3002.2 BUILDING
SEWER. Section P3002.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: Building sewer piping shall be
as shown in Table P3002.2. Forced main sewer piping shall conform to one of the standards for
ABS plastic pipe, cast-iron pipe, copper or copper-alloy tubing, PVC plastic pipe, or pressure-
rated pipe listed in Table P3002.2. In addition, building sewer piping shall be a minimum of
schedule 40 PVC/ABS or equivalent unless otherwise approved by the building official.

-Establishes a minimum material for sewer service.

7-939.- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION P3005.4.2 BUILDING
DRAIN AND SEWER SIZE AND SLOPE. Section P3005.4.2 is hereby amended to read as
follows: Pipe sizes and slope shall be determined from Table P3005.4.2 on the basis of
drainage load in fixture units (d.f.u.) computed from Table P3004.1. The minimum size of a
building sewer serving a dwelling unit shall be four inches.

-Establishes a minimum size for building sewer service.

7-940.- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION P3114.3 WHERE
PERMITTED. Section P3114.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: Individual vents, branch
vents, circuit vents and stack vents shall be permitted to terminate with a connection to an air
admittance valve only when approved by the Administrative Authority.

-States air admittance valves are only approved to be installed when approved.



7-941. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION E3601.6.2 SERVICE
DISCONNECT LOCATION. Section E3601.6.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: The
service disconnecting means shall be installed at a readily accessible location either outside of
a building or inside nearest the point of entrance of the service conductors. When service
conductors are more than 10 feet in length from the point of entry to the service panel, a
separate means of disconnect shall be installed at the service cable entrance to the building or
structure. Service disconnecting means shall not be installed in bathrooms. Each occupant
shall have access to the disconnect serving the dwelling unit in which they reside.

-States a maximum distance for a disconnect inside a building.

7-942 - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION E3901.4.5
RECEPTACLE OUTLET LOCATION. Section E3901.4.5 Receptacle outlet location is hereby
amended to read as follows: Receptacle outlets shall be located not more than 20 inches (508
mm) above the countertop or work surface. Receptacle outlet assemblies installed in
countertops and work surfaces shall be listed for use in countertops or work surfaces.
Receptacle outlets rendered not readily accessible by appliances fastened in place, appliance
garages, sinks or rangetops as addressed in the exception to Section 3901.4.1, or appliances
occupying dedicated space shall not be considered as these required outlets.

EXCEPTION: Receptacle outlets shall be permitted to be mounted not more than 12
inches (305 mm) below the countertop or work surface in construction designed for the
physically impaired or for island and peninsular countertops or work surface where the surface
is flat across its entire surface and the are no means to mount a receptacle within 20 inches
(508 mm) above the countertop, such as in an overhead cabinet. Receptacles mounted below
the countertop or work surface in accordance with this section shall not be located where the
countertop or work surface extends more than 6 inches (152 mm) beyond its support base.

-Allows receptacles to be installed on the side of island countertops that do not have a
backsplash.

7-943.- INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION E3902.2 GARAGE
AND ACCESSORY BUILDING RECEPTACLES. Section E3902.2 Garage and accessory
building receptacles is hereby amended to read as follows: All 125-volt, single-phase, 15- and
20- ampere receptacles installed in garages and grade level portions of unfinished accessory
buildings used for storage or work areas shall have ground-fault circuit interrupter protection for
personnel.

EXCEPTIONS:

1.) Receptacles that are not readily accessible such as a ceiling mounted receptacle for a
garage door opener.

2.) A single receptacle supplied by a dedicated branch circuit that is located and identified for a
specific use by a cord-and-plug-connected appliance such as a refrigerator, freezer or sump

pump.



3.) A receptacle supplying only a permanently installed fire alarm or burglar alarm system.

-Allows for receptacles in garages that are dedicated for specific appliances to not be
protected from ground-fault.

7-944. - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDED; SECTION E3902.5 UNFINISHED
BASEMENT RECEPTACLES. Section E3902.5 Unfinished basement receptacles is hereby
amended to read as follows: All 125-volt, single phase, 15- and 20- ampere receptacles
installed in unfinished basements shall have ground fault circuit interrupter protection for
personnel. For the purposes of this section, unfinished basements are defined as portions or
areas of the basement not intended as habitable rooms and limited to storage areas, work
areas, and the like.

Exceptions:

1.) Receptacles that are not readily accessible such as a ceiling mounted receptacle for a
garage door opener.,

2.) A single receptacle supplied by a dedicated branch circuit that is located and identified for a
specific use by a cord-and-plug-connected appliance such as a refrigerator, freezer or sump

pump.
3.) A receptacle supplying only a permanently installed fire alarm or burglar alarm system.

-Allows for receptacles in garages that are dedicated for specific appliances to not be
protected from ground-fault.



*s|elsaew Suijool

unsixa sy 01 3|gesedwod s|elsalew Suool pasocsdde 3zijan Aew pouad JeaA a3uy) Aue ul
Buuan02 Joou [B10] BY3 JO $S3] JO %0T jo siedas y "pouad sead aaiy) Aue ul SuliaAod Jool |e10)
9y} JO 59| 40 %0T ueyl s1ow Jo saiedas Aue sapnjoul Sulyoos-ay :a8endue| Buimo|jo) 3yl ppy

‘poliad Jeak-a34y1 Aue ul SuLI3A0D JOOU [B101 343 JO SS3| Jo Juadlad (gT) ual jo Jiedss ay)

104 pazI|nN sS3|UN paj|eIsul aq Jou ||eys Suijood palyisse|d-uop :a8ensue| Suimo||o) 3yl 113su|
D'g’v s930ul00) T'SOST 2qeL 219129

Aduaiaiy3 ASisul €1 49adeyd paisiRg

uap3 21YD Juelsissy Jad se sadueyd awes e

“llem Buiuie1as aya jo apis Y31y Y3 4o 3934 (OT) UIYHM Je sadelns Sulyjem Usym

apesd anoge, Q€ A0 s|jem Sululelal 1e paJinbas aJe spieng :afendue] Buimo||oy Byl ppY
uap3 ja1y) 1uelsissy Jad se sadueyd awes e

"824n0s

Sunysi| jeuss1xa Jo |eusau) ue Ag pareulwn)) Buiaq jo sjgeded aq [jeys SJa30eleyd SSaUPPY
*pasSaIPPE 3 ||_ys J0OP yoea ‘Suip|ing Ayl JO SAPIS JUIIBYIP U0 PILIO| SBIUEIIUS 3jdi3Nw
BABY SJUBUDY 2J3YM SBUIP|ING [BI2J3WWOD JURUA-NNW u| :a8endue| Buimo||o) 3yl ppy

"AJUO ZDL UOII93S 00S DI 4O Suawalinbal ayl Jwo Aew 3502 123foid [e303

Y1 JO %0F uey) 193eau S ZO/ UONI3S 00S D1 YuMm s2ueljdwlod JO 1500 3yl 3Jaym suonippe
1o suoijesalje oSiapun 1eys sapuednido 3 dnosg - uonndacxj :adendue| BuiMmo||0) aUl PPY
'9p07 @414 pue Suipjing @Jeds UBdUERLIAIGNS

‘7 Jaydey) OIS Y3 Ul pauUap se sanjanuas “/ uoindadx3 :adenBue| Buimo||o) ayl ppY
a3en3ueq pasodouyg

$J001 YN JO JiedaJ JouIW MO||e

padinbas Bunes wnwiuiw 3, Ssep2
pasinbas Sunes wnwiuiw 5, ssepd
sjuawalinbas Aduaidiye Adiaua |B20] asn

D41 YHM JU3SISUOD

papaau uaym sjjem 3uiuieldls jo apis-ysiy uo spiend
941 6 1a1dey) se awes Jg| 6 Jaydey)

$32UBJIUD UlEW UBYL JBYI0 1B 530eds 1ueual Ajnuap!

syoafosd 3 dnoud [jews uo [043U0D 150D

IpPod 7eds ueauelaigns |ed20| a1esodiodul

|euoney /iuazu|

Suyoosay T'TIST

Suljooy payIsse|2uoN §'SOST
8u113A0) JOOY T'SOST 2198l
Aouaniy3 ABisug g1 Ja1deyd
say21eT 3 94201 °6'T°0T0T

SpJeno Z'sT0T
(uap3) D41 yew g sardeyd

uonedIUP| SSAIPPY T°Z0S

SI9Y|FYS ULAIS e

sduipjing punossiapun T°S0F
uonRIas AP0

JWwns 5,337

jwwing 5,337
JWwINg 5,337
Jwwns 5,337
Jwwng 5,337

JWWNS 5,937
WG s,397

ywiwng s,2a7

Jwwng 5,337

Jwwng 5,337
uonapsung
281



'palalap ag ||im 60TE UONIAS

“(s)uresp gejssapun ayl 1noysnouyl adeuiep sadoid ainsua

0} ge|S 21342U02 3y} OIUl PRIl Aj31enbape aJe Yaiym suesw [eaiueydaw Ag paysoddns aq
lleYS |ela3eW (|1} pa12edWOdUN UO P3||BISUI SUIBJP qB|SISPUN JOoLRIU| “|erRylo Bulp|ing 3yl Aq
panoidde si pue paloaiold aq o1 (s)ease |je oy aSeulelp Ilenbape apinoud |Im 1eYL JAUUBW
e u| ‘10 ‘paiaaro.d aq 01 (S)ease ay) Jo J23dwuad JaUUI 3Y1 PUNOIE PI|RISUI 3G ||BYS WIISAS
a8eulelp qejs-Japun 3y "waisAs aeuleip Ja1em WI01S panosdde ue 01 SuBaW [edlueyIaw
10 Mines3 Aq a81eyasip ||eYys pue ‘waisAs adeulelp ay3 Ul s}isodap jo uone|nwnade

3yl sziwiuiw o3 adols |edInau Jo annsod yum padeld 3q jleys ‘pa13io.d aq 01 (s)eaue

ay1 mojaq 1o 1e paj|eIsul 39 ||Bys S|eLialew Jo swalsAs panosdde Jaylo Jo adid pajesopad
‘53|11 @8euUlelg "ge|S JOOJ) BYI MOJRq PaPIACd 3 ||BYS SUleJp ‘DpeJE Mo|aq pa1eo| adeds
3|gesn Jo 3|qeligey ISO[IUI PUE YLIES UIB)3J SUollepuno; aJaym :aden3ue| 3uimo||o) ayl ppy

193deyd syl JO UOIIR|OIA B 3q ||eYS 05 Op 01 3Jn|ie}

pue “82130U 3y uo pa1els polsad Wil Ayl uiyum ‘Alsadoud 1usdelpe ay1 uo pasned swa|qoid
3yl @1euIW|d 0] sainseaw ajendosdde el ||eys Alsadoad ay) JO JaUMO 2yl ‘UONE|OIA 3y

JO 32110U UM USAIS SBY [B121JJ0 PO 3Y1 PUE 1SIX3 SUOIIIPUOD YINS BIAYM JUWIDI0T I
"3yl

Auadoud Suiuiolpe Aue woJj 193) 3Al UBY) J350|2 padleydsip ag 03 siapjulids ume] Fuipnoxa
Sa2IN0S Je|IWIs JaYJo Jo ‘saysemyoeq |ood Sulwwims ‘sjood SUILUWIMS ‘SUIBIP UOIIEPUNO
‘synodsumop ‘sdwnd dwns woJ) s98JeYISIp S8 YINSs $33IN0S JUSINWIIUL WIoY 133em (Z)
"JI31BM JO MOJ} 3] 101353J Ajliessadauun Jou op Aayl papiaold

SB2UE YINS Ul p23I212 g Aew $adu24 ~23eulelp apadwi Jo ‘Aladoad Sujuiolpe syl ojue
J918M LIBAIP “Aliadoud juadelpe uo Buipuod 318310 ||IM YdIym 3|ems pasaaulBua 1o ‘Ajjioey
uonualap ‘Aem adeulesp AUe UIYlIM PIUIBIUIEW JO Pa||eISUl ‘paleald aq 03 uoPniIsqo (1)
:Aue asnea Jo mojje [|eys uosiad oN :12npuo3 palqiyold g

"le1diyjo Buipjing a4y Ag paniem ssajun saf ey a8euiesp panosdde piemol

1us2J3d OM] UBY] SS3| 10U JO J31JP3J3YL 1uaIpesd BuluieIp Ylim SWi3 0] W1} WOl papudwe se
‘apo2 Sulp|ing |EUOIIBUIBIUI DY Ul J0J papIAcid se Juaipeld a8eulelp e aABY |[BYS UOIIRPUNO)
Suip|ing ay3 Buipunolins eaie 3y] "}00J U0 JO WNWIUIW e aul| Apadold ayy wouy

%0Bq 135 ||eys 52005 Jo 201 3yL "sAem aFeulep Se U0IIdUNY 01 PaUSIsap a4 ||eys S3IN3ONIIS
uaamiaq saui| Apadoud 3uimange ‘jeniyo 3uip(ing ayl Aq panoidde Ajjeaydads 3Je s3|ems
pue shem aBeuresp paiylaads SSIjUN "SIINAIP |04IUOD AISOIZ JO UOLE||eIsul Aq pajuaAald

3q ||eys a81eydsip Jo eae Y3 Ul punold JO UOISOLT 'IIUBAIAUCD PUE UOII||02 J0U lod
panosdde Y10 JO ‘92URADAUCD JIMIS WI0LS ‘ABm 3BRUIRIp 1SDIE3U BU3 03 S131eM Adled 0}
paudisap aq ||eys saiy|oey 28eulelp ||y 'y SpJepuels wnwiully a8en3due| 3uimo||o) a3yl ppy

paidope aq 03
pasodoud jou apo) eds/|00d SUILLIWIMS [BUOIIEUIDIU]

sjuaWaJINbaJ aSeulelp J31EM WLIOIS [BJ0] 1RJ0dI0dUl

sjuawalinbas afeulelp Ja1em WI0IS |BI0| a1eiodiodul

sqn] 10H/sedS/s|00d BUIIWIMS 60TE

walsAg adeuleq |1osqns T'#'SO8T

Buipesn IS T 08T

Jwwng s,937

Jwwng $,237

JWwng 5,997



"TSOT 3SSY 01 W.OJUOD [|BYS SBAIRA

souenIwpe Jie 3dAl-ydue.q pue-|enpiaIpul ‘0S0T
ISSY O3 WIOJUOD [|BYS SAN[EA ddUBIWpPE Jie adAl-yels
‘U01193s SIY) yum Aldwios j|eys sanjea asueniwpe

J1e Buizijn swalsAs JuaA "ANIOYINY 2A1RISIUILPY
2yl Aq panosdde uaym pamoj||e AjUO aJe BA[BA
asuenwpe Jiy :a8endue|] Suimol|o 3yl 3IN1NSGNS
sayoul g :a8en8ue| Buimo|joj ay1 asu|

T'TL uondas 3191e@

swasAs uonediul ume| 10j SAdIASP MOJj-)deq
punoJd-u| :uoindadx3 :28endue| BuIMO||0) AY) LIBSU|

“(Wwpgr'0E) 199 00T PIIIXD 10U ||BYS "JI1BM
pasadwa)l 10 10y d11Nbad Jeyy SaUNIXIY Ay} 03 JAJem

10y JO 32.n0s 3y woJy ‘Suidid sajem pasadwa) Jo 10y
40 y13ua| padojanap ay] :aden3ue| Buimo||0) Yl WasU|

‘suieaunoy SupjuLp paJinbas ay)

10} p31M1I1sqns aq 01 pajyiwiad g [|eys Juls uayaly
B 1IM SWOOJ }ea.q Jo siasuadsip ia1em pajioq
‘512|002 Ja1em ‘patinbal aie sulejunoy Sunjuiip 1aym
‘sapuednazo Jaylo uj :adendue| Suimol|oy 3yl 1asU|
T'¥' €0t UoIIRS 2392

"22eds 2y3 Jo ysiuly pue adAy ‘azis

3y1 03 anp AJesSaIBUUN PIWIIP I ‘[eIRy0 Suip|ing
3y} 40 uonaudsIp ayl je ‘pasnbai ag 10u Aew yuis
@01nu3s i — 8 310U1004 (T E0Y 2|qe1 03 3 310U100) PPY

QW ‘Bwwing 5,337 o AND a2yl jo Juawedaq sanin
13180 2yl Aq paquasaud s3idijod syl yum aduepiedde
Ul 8q ||BYS SaI|qUIasSe uoiuanald mopyaeq o Sunysal
pue uonaadsuy| : :a8endue| Suimo||o} 3yl NSNS
sayaul T :@8en8ue| Suimojjo ay3 uasu|

28en3ueq pasodoug

AYY JO SN ay1 SZjwiuIwW
Y319y Wnwiuiw ysiqeisa
pasinbaJ 10u Ajleduolsly

uo3eSLII UME| J0) UDI}d3IX3 OuU

aA132111584 0] 3q 01 3YSnoyl

1X3]} SMO|
ST Ul IN/JID| J3A0 SEM SIUYY SBM ZT Ul Indul

papaau 10U si §S 18y} Yyons aq Aew saysiuly 1oLl

od gms 1ad
yidap wnuiuiw ysijgeisa
|euoney/auaiu|

S3A|BA BoUBLIWPE 1Y T'816
uoIsuaIXa Jooy T €06
SDAJeA Jojemoeqg T'H#T.L

sJa1uanaad
MO|poeq JO U0Id3104d Z°ST'809

SaunIxy
01 Ajddns J31em pasadwal Jo 10H Z°£09

uonnNINSgNs ¢ 0Tt
a8eusis |euonaaag T'v 0T

saunixy Suiquinid paJinbau
40 JaqWinu WNWIUIN T'E0% 2|98l

sa1|quasse uonuanaid

mo|pdeq o 8unsa) ¥y uonadsul OT'ZTE
y3dap JaMIS T'H'SOE

uonIIs IPO)

NWWNS 5,327
JWLINS 5,937
Jwwng 5,297

Jwwng 5,227

Jwwng 5,897

jwwng 5,937
HWWING 5,397

Jwwng 5,397

WS s,997
HWWNg 5,937
uonNpsunr

2dl



Jamod jo ased ul uonesado dwns sadoud Bunnsse

jo ajqede (s)walsAs dn-ydeq yum papiaoid aq |eys
(s)8uiuado Jo (s)ulesp JouRIx pasodxa Aue woly Jaem
w031s uinasal sdwng :a8endue| Suimo||o) ay) Lasu|

‘walsAs Jamas AJejiues syl 01 paldsuuod

uiaq wouy pangiyosd Ajjesnynads ase (S)waisAs

10 (5)2|2e3d2224 a8eulelp J131EM WIOLS JAY10 Aue

pue synodsumop 431In8 ‘sujelp pJeA ‘sulelp uollepunoy
‘sdwind dwins JO UOIIIFUUOD "WIISAS J1IMIs

Asenues ay3 o1ul Buniajua o Suidieydsip ‘Suluiesp
W04} J51EM PUNOJE JO WI0IS ||B JuaA3.d 03 Jsuuew

B 4INs Ul paulelulew pue 1jing ‘pausdisap aq |leys
swia1sAs Jamas Aseyiues :a8endue| Suimo)joy 3yl 1asuy|

“#Y0T ISSV 40 8TOT 35SV

0] WJOJUO ||eys aAjeA Jawlid |eas desl v "paj|eisul

aq [|eys aAeA Jawiid [eas desl e Jo [eas (ww ZoT)
yaui-inoj e jo Sunsisuod deuy [eas-daap e ‘uonesoders
AQ $50] 03 123/gns s1 |B3S desl B 3J3YM saInIxly
9|qIssa22e 01 Bunejes sudisap |edads 1oy Jadaap Jo
‘(ww zQT) Sayaul () 1O} UBYL 240W 10U pUE (WW TG)
Saydul () OM1 UBY SS3| 10U JO [BaS PInbi| B 3ARY |[BYS
deuy aunixyy yoe3 :a8endue| Suimo||o) 2yl 21n1ISqNS

1amod dn-yaeq pasu sulelp pasodxs

sjuawaJinbau |edo| a3es0diodU)

Ayjigixal) smoje

peay pue Ajpedes dund TTETTT

I4oid £'T0TT

s|eas del| $'Z00T

HWWNS 5,237

Jwwns 5,337

jwwng 5,331



‘E0FUOIID3S YIIM 3DUBPIOIIE Ul
SUEdW |EDIUBYDAW AQ JO ZOt UCIIIDS YIIM SIUBPIOIIE
Ul sueaw [eanieu Ag pa1e|IuUaA 3 ||eys 32eds
Asuednaoo Asang :98en3ue| Suimoj|o) ay) 2In11IsgNS
93en8ueq pasodoig

paidope aq 03 pasodoud 10u 733
|euoney/iuau|

paJinbal uoie|IUAA T IOV
uonIIS IPO)

HWwng 5,337
uonANpsung
1]



*SNOILd30X3

‘|Jauuosiad Joy uoidalold Jardniiaiul

3IN2.12 3nej-puno.d aAey [|BYS SEAJE JI0M IO IFeJ01S

10} pasn s3up|ing AJOSS328 pPaysiulun Jo suoiuod |3A3]
apesd pue sadesed ul pajeisul sajaerdadal asedwe -0z pue
-GT ‘@seyd-2|3uls “1JOA-GZ T ||V :SMO||0} SE PERJ 0] PIpUWle
AgaJay si s39e1dad31 Sulp|ing Asossadoe pue a8elen
1SMO||0} SB pESJ 01 papuawe AgaJay s! (zHv)g 0Tz uoidas

-aseq poddns s31 pucAaq (ww ZsT)

S3YIUI § UBY] SJ0W SPUSIXD DIBLINS HI0M JO dOLIBIUN0D
YL BIBYM PIIEDO| 3G 10U [|BYS UOIIDSS SILL LM 3DUepPIODIe
Ul 92B1NS 3JOM 10 dOLIIIUNOT SYI MOJ2G PAAUNOW
53|0e1d303Y "18UIGED PRIYIIAC UR Ul SB yINns ‘dopaiunod
3yl anoge (Ww gos) sayaul 0z uIym ajperdadss

B JUNOW 0] SUB3W OU dJe 3Y] PUR 3DEJINS 311IUS 531 550408
1B[4 S1 2IBLNS BY1 2IBYM 3DB4INS }JOM JO SAOLI2IUNOD
Jejnsuiuad pue puejsi Joj Jo pasiedwi AjjeaisAyd ayl

104 pauBISap UOI1INJISUOD Ul 3JB4INS YJ0M 10 doLI2IUN0d
2yl mojaq (Www §OE) SaYaul ZT Uyl 2JO0W 10U Pajunow
29 01 panwiad 3 [|Bys S13)3N0 39e1dad3Y :NOILIIDX

'$1913N0 pasinbal 3say) se paJapIsuod aq Jou

|1eys adeds pajeaipsp SuiAdnaao saauerdde Jo ‘uondaox3
(1)D)ZS 01z ul pasanos se sdojadued 1o syuis ‘sagesed
aouel|dde “ase|d ul pauaise; ssoueldde Ag 9|qissadde
AIpe34 10U PAIBPUSI SIDINO 3|2e3daI3Y "S2IBMNS

oM 10 SOHAIUNOD Ul ISN JO) PA1SI| 3Q ||BYS SIIBLINS HIOM
pue sdo121unod Ul paj|eIsul sal|quiasse Ja)Iino ajoeldadsay
*32B4NS YJOM JO dOLB1UNOD 3y} PA0GE (W 8OS) sayaut

07 UBY] 3J0OW JOU paledo| aq ||eyYs $19]In0 3j2e1daday
1SMO||04 SB peas 01 papuawe AgaJay st (S5)(D)zs 0Tz uondas

*24n1anJls
Q341 0} 22ULIIUD B|GED 3IIAISS 3] 1B P3||BISUI
3Q ISNLW 123UU0ISIP JO sueaw ajesedas e ‘|aued 321AIDS

2y 03 A13ua jo ulod ayy wodj Yy1dua| ul 199y (OT) U1 URYY
2JOW 3JE SI012NPUOI 3IURIIUS 3DIAIIS UIYAA "SI03INPUOT
92IAJBS Y] JO BOURJIUD JO JUIOd BYI 15IEU IPISUL

1o Bulp|ing e jo 9pISING JAY3ID UOI1BIO| 2|qIsSadde Ajipeal

B )B pa||BISUI 3 [[BYS SUBIW FUI1I3UU0ISIP 3IINIS 3YL
1SMO||04 SB peaJ 01 papuswe Agasay st (T)(V)0L 0EE uonIas
28en3ueq pasodold

241 3Y3 YIIM JUIIsISU0D

sade.es 3un 3uliamg (2)(v)g 01z

J¥1 241 Y3IM JUBISISUOD SUONEIO| 13)IN0 310e3daday (S){D)ZS 01T

DY YIM JUB1SISUOD "ALIGIX3|4 SMOJ[E
|euoney /iuaiu]

uol3e20] 3|qIssale
Allpeay (T)(v)0L'0€Z 23N L1027
uonaag apod

HWWINS 5,397

UWWNG 5,397

Jwiwng 5,927
uondIpsuNg
J3IN



‘wa1sAs wueje Jejding Jo wueje
241y paj|esul Apuauewdad e Ajuo BulAlddns appeidadal v ('€

‘dwnd dwns 1o 132334}

‘101849811494 B SE Y2nSs aoueljdde pajrauuod-3n|d-pue-piod
e Ag asn J1y123ds e 10} P31J1IUBPI PUB PIIEIO| S1 1BYL INID
youe.q pajedipap e Ag paijddns apeydadsas 9j8uis v (2

-1auado Joop 28eled e 10} ajpe1dadas. pajunow Buijiad
€ SB YoNs 3|gIssade A|IpeaJ 10U 3Je 18yl s3)de1dsasy (T
:suondaix3

‘ayl| ay3 pue

‘seaJe yJom ‘sease 3884015 O] PIIIWI| PUB SWOOU 3|geugey
SE papualul JOU 1USWISE] 3y JO SeaJe Jo suolyod se
PauULaP 2JE SIUSWISEQ PAYSIUIUN ‘UOIIIBS SIYY Jo sasodind
3y 104 "J2uuosiad Joj uoilzaloud Jaadniialul Undad

3jney punoJs SABY [|RYS SIUSWISE] Paysiuyun ul pa|je3sul
sajae1dasal asadwe -pz pue -6T ‘@seyd 3|3uIs "YOA-SZT IV
1SMO]|0} SB peaJ 0] papuawe Agasay s! (S)(v)8 0Tz uonass
“walsAs wuee sgjding 40 wiee

241y pajjeisul AjpuauewJad e Ajuo SuiAjddns ajpeadadas v ('€

‘dwnd dwns 10 J13z33.)

‘103eJ281394 B Se yons aoueljdde pajoauuod-3njd-pue-piod
e Ag asn 21129ds e 10j PayIIUaP! pPUe Paiedo| sl 1_Y3 HNJJID
youeuq paiedipap e Aq paljddns ajoeidasad aBuis v (7

‘1uado Joop a3e.ed e 1oy 32e1dadas pajunow 3
B SE YINs 3|q1ss323e A|Ipea. J0u aJe 1eyl sajpeidasay (‘T

DYl 3Yl Ylim 1ua1sIsuod

lusawaseq
paysiuyun syun 3ulama (s)(v)e otz

JWWINS 5,337



-adid ay1 Jo Y18uaals p|atA wnwiuiw

payads ays jo uaniad (05) Ayl ueyy Jeeass

Suidid ayy w1 559435 dooy e saanpoud jeyl anjen e
paadxa J0u |[eys ainssaud 1531 9yl ‘(edy z9g) Bisd (szT)
3AI}-AJUaM] PaJpUNY U0 spa3dXa aJnssaud 1533 Ay}
asaypn Sisd (09) Alxis uey) ss2| aq 10U ||eys ainssaud
1531 2y} ‘2.nssaid UWN|od J31eMm S3YIUI {T) UIlaUNOY
J0 55303 ul saunssald je sed JuiAued 3uidid Joy

pue ‘Buidid papjam 104 ainssaud udissp Jo andadsa.
(ed 6'89) Sisd (QT) Ua1 ueyl ss3| 10u Ing ‘eunssazd
Sunpom wnwixew pasodoad ay) sawi jjey-auo pue
3UO UBY] SSB] 10U 3 ||BYS PAsN 3q 03 a.nssa.d 1593 Ay
SMO||0} SB peaJ 0} PSpulwWe Agatay sl T'v'90y Uoi1das

uO01393S IU Y} R3]

U013 B41IUD AYL 3132Q
uOI123S JJNUI Y} A123|aQ
U013 AJIUA Ayl a13[aq
UOIIAS BJIUB Ay} B3[eg
uonIAs BJIIUB 3Y1 313|2a

28en8ue pasodoad

{2¥1) 2p0) |BIIUSPISAY [BUOIIEUIIU| S SWeS

a|qedwon jou 9N a41dg

3|q1edwod 10u oN aads
a|qredwod jou 9N aads
a|qiiedwod jou oN aads
a|quedwod jou 9N 21ds
3|qiedwod 10u N s41ds

|euoney fiuau|

T¥90r
Buign wnuwnpy ¢'s°€0Y
guigns Aojje Jaddod g Jaddo) £'5'€0r

|o9)s ssajuIels TS EQP

Suiqny 9IS T'S'E'Y
wnulwny 'y g0y

Aojje saddo2 1 1addo) €4 E0F
uonIIS apo)

JqWwNS 5,937
Hwwng s,2a7

JIWWNS 5,997
Jwwng s,337
NWIWNS 5,337
Jwwng 5,397
YWWING 5,397
uonapsunf

pLE|



Proposed Significant Changes from the 2012 International Residential
Code to the 2018

Table R301.2(1) Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria.
Ice Barrier Underlayment Required. Yes
Change:

This section now requires two layers of roofing underlayment or a self-adhering polymer-
modified bitumen sheet to be installed at the lowest edges of roof surfaces to extend to not less
than 24 inches inside the exterior wall line. The added layers of protection prevent water
damage to dwellings that are created from ice forming at the lowest point and thawing.

Section 507 Decks.
Change:

The IRC in previous adopted additions has not given prescriptive requirements for deck
construction. The 2018 code now has a section for minimum deck design and construction.

Section E3901.9 Basements, garages and accessory buildings.
Change:

Requires receptacles to be installed in each bay of a garage.

E3902.16 Arc-fault circuit-interrupter protection.
Change:

This will require Arc-fault circuit-interrupter protection for all 120 volt 15 and 20 amp outlets in a
house. This has previously been amended to only require arc-fault protection in bedrooms.

Section E4002.14 Tamper-resistant receptacles.
Change:

This will require all accessible 15 — 20 amp receptacles to be tamper resistant.



